
 

 

 

Key Stage 3 Curriculum Map 2019 - 2020 

 Term 1 

Subject: Art  Year Group: 7 

Week/Date Focus/Topic Objectives Key Skills Home Learning/Resources 

1 
Sept 2nd-5th 

 Baseline assessment-LO: To create tonal drawing of the portrait using the grid. 

 Theory focus: Art Elements-line, shape, form, tone, space, texture. 

 Technique-pencil shading. 

2 -7 
Sept 8th-Oct 17th 

 Scheme: Observational 
drawing, achromatic 
painting, portrait drawing. 

 Theme: Portraits 

 Theory focus: art elements; 
shape (geometric), line, 
tone, form, space. 
Proportions of face. 

 Technique: drawing, 
painting 

 10 lessons 

 To define the Art 
Elements verbally and in 
written format. 

 To apply understanding of 
the Art Elements ,(line, 
shape, tone, form, space) 

       to practical visual work.  

 To create an observational 
drawing from a secondary 
source image. 

 To apply understanding of 
the grid drawing method.  
 

 Practical use of grid 

drawing method. 

 Observational 

drawing skills. 

 Demonstration of 

understanding of the 

Art Elements through 

practical application. 

 Paint mixing to 

create tints and 

shades in a greyscale. 

 Presentation. 

 Self-evaluation. 

 Art Elements 
Worksheet. 

 Wedha pop-art-
reading article 

8 
Oct 20th -24th  

Mid Term Break 

9-15 
Oct 27th-Dec 12th 

 Scheme:  Observational 
drawing 

 Theme: Study of Drapery 

 Theory focus: Art elements; 
line, shape, tone, form, 
texture 

 3 lessons 

 To create geometric shape 
composition in Wedha pop 
art style. 

 To apply practical skills of 
the use of art materials; 
pencil, paint. 

 To self-evaluate work in 
terms of use of Art 
elements and practical 
skills. 

 Observational 

drawing skills. 

 Presentation 

 Self-evaluation 

 

 Reading-research 
artist Albrecht Durer 



  To apply understanding of 
the Art Elements to 
practical visual work (line, 
shape, tone, form texture) 

 To create an observational 
drawing from a secondary 
source image. 

 To apply practical skills of 
the use of art materials; 
types of paper, pencils. 

 To apply mixed media 
technique. 

  

Winter Break: December 13th – January 2nd 

 

 

 


